


FEAR 3 LOST IN LAKE 
  AS ICE RESCUE FAILS;  
    MIDWEST COLD WORSE 

Charlevoix, Mich., Feb.10 
(A.P.) – Searchers for two 
fishermen and a coast guardsman 
who had attempted to rescue them 
from the ice and was swept away 
with them, expressed grave fear 
today the three had perished in a 
Lake Michigan blizzard and gale. 
With visibility on the lake limited 
“to less than 100 yards” and a 
strong wind breaking the ice floes 
into pieces, fellow coast guardsmen 
said hope that Earl Cunningham 
and the fisherman Claude 
Beardsley, 45, and Clayton Brown, 
22, would be found was “remote”. 
   Two other persons, trapped for 13 
hours in 9-below zero weather in a 
small boat outside the ice off South 
Manitou Island, were rescued by 
coast guardsmen and returned to 
the island to thaw out. To save their 
mail boat from being crushed in the 
ice, August Warner and his son, 
Julius, anchored 1-3/4 miles from 
the island. Coast guardsmen, after 
an all-night battle, reached the pair 
Sunday morning. 
    Severe conditions on Lake 
Michigan frustrated all efforts to 
find the three missing men near 
Charlevoix Sunday. A coast guard 
search party headed by Boatswain 
George Kelderhouse used dynamite 
to blast a channel through 300 feet 
of ice and cruised the lake for 
several hours in a powered lifeboat 
without finding the trio. The cutter 
Escanaba battled floes 
unsuccessfully for six hours outside 
of Muskegon harbor in a futile 
effort to join the search. 
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